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From: Erik R. Peck

To: Craig Ochoa (External); Sam Santangelo

Cc: Katy Dolan Baumer; Craig Ochoa

Subject: RE: Magnolia Resurfacing Project - Bid Opening
Date: Monday, September 26, 2016 9:09:24 AM

Good Morning All — yes it all seems to be in good order and | have see no reason why the bid
cannot be accepted .

Erik R. Peck | Partner

Tressler LLP

233 South Wacker Drive

22nd Floor

Chicago, IL 60606

Telephone: 312-627-4023 | Fax: 312-627-1717
epeck@tresslerllp.com| www.tresslerllp.com | www.tresslerllp.com/erik-peck

ﬁ Thank you for considering the environmental impact of printing emails.

This message, including attachments, is covered by the Electronic Communication Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C., sections 2510-2521, is
CONFIDENTIAL and may also be protected by ATTORNEY/CLIENT PRIVILEGE. If you believe you received this e-mail in error, do
not read it. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any retention, dissemination, distribution, or
copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, I did not intend to
waive and do not waive any privileges or confidentiality of this message or the attachments. Please reply to the sender that you
have received the message in error, then delete it. Thank you.

IRS Circular 230 Disclosure: To comply with certain U.S. Treasury regulations, we inform you that, unless expressly stated
otherwise, any U.S. federal tax advice contained in this communication, including attachments, was not intended or written to be
used, and cannot be used, by any taxpayer for the purpose of avoiding any penalties that may be imposed on such taxpayer by the
Internal Revenue Service. In addition, if any such tax advice is used or referred to by other parties in promoting, marketing or
recommending any partnership or other entity, investment plan or arrangement, then (i) the advice should be construed as
written in connection with the promotion or marketing by others of the transaction(s) or matter(s) addresses in this
communication and (ii) the taxpayer should seek advice based on the taxpayer's particular circumstances from an independent
tax advisor.

From: Craig Ochoa [mailto:Info@yourenumberl.com]
Sent: Saturday, September 24, 2016 7:46 AM

To: 'Sam Santangelo'; Erik R. Peck

Cc: 'Katy Dolan Baumer'; ‘Craig Ochoa'

Subject: FW: Magnolia Resurfacing Project - Bid Opening

Good morning Sam and Erik,
Hope you both had a good weekend.

Based on Steve Berecz’s below and attached e-mail,
are you in agreement with awarding our Magnolia Lane
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road resurfacing project to Chicagoland Paving?
Look forward to hearing from you. THANKS gentleman!!

Best regards,

Craig

Hwy. Comm.
Hanover Township
250S.Rt. 59
Bartlett, IL 60103
(630) 213-9999

From: Steven Berecz [mailto:sberecz@gha-engineers.com]
Sent: Friday, September 23, 2016 11:16 AM

To: Craig Ochoa
Cc: Craig Ochoa; Sam Santangelo; Katy Dolan Baumer; Erik R. Peck
Subject: Re: Magnolia Resurfacing Project - Bid Opening

Craig & All:
A PDF of our recommendation for project award to Chicagoland Paving is attached.

Craig, as we discussed today, GHA will prepare the contracts and send them to Chicagoland
Paving for processing. We will follow the general format from the last project that we worked
on for you, which was in 2013.

Steven D. Berecz, PE
Senior Engineer

2]

625 Forest Edge Drive | Vernon Hills, lllinois 60061
Office: (847) 478-9700 | Fax: (847) 478-9701

Direct: (847) 821-6217 | Email: sherecz@gha-engineers.com
www.gha-engineers.com

On Wed, Sep 21, 2016 at 12:58 PM, Craig Ochoa <Info@yourenumberl.com> wrote:
Thanks Steve.

As much as | hate to ask you this..........I'd prefer your response in writing (e-mail).
This way I/we will have a paper trail of your review of the 2 bids from yesterday.
Again, SORRY for the inconvenience!!

Look forward to hearing from you Steve.

Many thanks.
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Best regards,
Craig
You're #1, Inc.

(630) 213-9999

From: Steven Berecz [mailto:sberecz@gha-engineers.com]

Sent: Wednesday, September 21, 2016 10:58 AM

To: Craig Ochoa

Cc: Craig Ochoa; Sam Santangelo; Katy Dolan Baumer; Erik R. Peck
Subject: Re: Magnolia Resurfacing Project - Bid Opening

Yes | will and plan on discussing with you at our meeting on friday.
Thanks,

Steven D. Berecz, PE
Senior Engineer

625 Forest Edge Drive | Vernon Hills, lllinois 60061
Office: (847) 478-9700 | Fax: (847) 478-9701

Direct: (847) 821-6217 | Email: sberecz@gha-engineers.com
www.gha-engineers.com

On Tue, Sep 20, 2016 at 4:40 PM, Craig Ochoa <Info@yourenumberl.com> wrote:
Good afternoon Steve,

As you know, we held our Hanover Township Highway Dept. Magnolia Lane
road resurfacing bid opening earlier this morning.

We have 6 contractors who submitted bids.

Please see attached information. Our Clerk, Katy Dolan Baumer, has done a nice
job preparing all the paperwork!

Can you please go through each of A-Lamp’s and Chicagoland Paving’s documentations

to be 100% sure everything is accurate? | want to be sure each company is comparing/bidding
apples to apples on everything. Since the bid amounts are so close (only $940.95 separates

the 2 different bids). 1 don’t want anything to come back to bite us later after the lowest

bid has been awarded.

Thanks Steve. Look forward to hearing from you.

Best regards,

Craig Ochoa

Hwy. Comm. — Hanover Township
250 S. Rt. 59

Bartlett, IL 60103

(630) 213-9999
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From: Katy Dolan Baumer [mailto:kdolanbaumer@hanover-township.org]
Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2016 11:38 AM

To: Craig Ochoa; Sam Santangelo

Subject: Magnolia Resurfacing Project

Hi, Craig and Sam.
Here is the Bid results and top two, as requested. Let me know if you need anything else.

i HANOVER

7 TOWNSHIP
Kat9 Dolan Baumer

Clerk
Hanover Township

(630) 837-0301
(630) 483-5689 fax
(312) 215-5577 cell

Illinois has a Freedom of Information Act pertaining to public records. Most written communications (including email) to or from Township
officials and staff could be considered public records which would be available to the public and media upon request. Your email
communications may therefore be subject to public disclosure. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or the employee or
agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended recipient, you ate hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, forwarding,
ot copying of this communication is strictly prohibited under United States Code, Title 18, Sections 2510-2521. If received in error, please
notify the sender immediately by reply e-mail and delete the original message, including attachments. Please consider the environment before

printing this e-mail.
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